
OLE Experience in Practice Assessment Rubric

ILO Exemplary Sufficient Insufficient

#1) Identify emerging
vocational and/or academic
interests based on the
experience.

vocation: It’s living your life on
purpose, directed toward both
your personal flourishing and
the common good.

Identifies/names at least one
vocational or academic
interest based on the
experience AND provides a
specific example of a future
action that they will take as a
result.

Identifies/names at least one
vocational or academic
interest based on the
experience but does not
describe any future actions
they will take as a result.

Provides no examples of a
vocational or academic
interest based on the
experience.

#2) Integrate prior/concurrent
coursework with the
experience.

Connects St. Olaf coursework
with OEP experience with a
specific example.

Names general skill or
knowledge base, likely
acquired through coursework,
but does not give a specific
example.

Provides no connection
between St. Olaf coursework
and OEP experience.

#3) Evaluate skills and roles,
including those that help
them contribute to the
community.

Evaluates/integrates
roles/skills and contributions
in a named
community/current
experience.

Identifies roles and skills AND
a named community. This may
include a rearticulation of the
named community from the
prompt.

Provides no evidence or is not
able to articulate any roles OR
skills that contributed to a
named community.

https://wp.stolaf.edu/lutherancenter/the-lutheran-center/vocation-at-st-olaf/

